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Alerts

1 event
33 results matching for 'Assignments before Grant' during September 2008.

Number Title Date
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2003204582 Reel 17 Sep 2008

2003217551 Knee arthroplasty prosthesis and method 17 Sep 2008

2003220701 Method of manufacturing a mesh screen 17 Sep 2008

2003276536 Rearview mirror assembly 17 Sep 2008

2004226701 Self-aligning tissue growth guide 17 Sep 2008

2004254288 Elastic joint element and fastener assembly incorporating the same 17 Sep 2008

2004283116 Cleaning device 17 Sep 2008

2004283133 Mirror glass component comprising an integrated luminous film 17 Sep 2008

2004293659 Fire mitigation 17 Sep 2008

2004293662 Pressure impulse mitigation 17 Sep 2008

2004298335 Use of biocide-containing, waterredispersible polymer powder compositions in mineral
construction materials

17 Sep 2008

2004314343 Electrochemical nitrate destruction 17 Sep 2008

2005202542 Hanger for a cable 17 Sep 2008

2005202680 Information system for telecommunications 17 Sep 2008

2005205783 Austroasca and sminthurus viridis resistant lucerne 17 Sep 2008

2005232836 Exterior rearview mirror for vehicles, especially for motor vehicles 17 Sep 2008

2005251296 Display of enhanced content 17 Sep 2008

2005311727 Providing purchasing opportunities for performances 17 Sep 2008

2005313585 Hydrophobing polymer powder that can be redispersed in water 17 Sep 2008

2005315934 Process for the stabilization of dusting surfaces 17 Sep 2008

2006201985 Method and apparatus for electronic trading of financial instruments 17 Sep 2008

2006202914 Anti-idiotypic antibody neutralizing the inhibitor activity of a factor VIII inhibitor
antibody

17 Sep 2008

2006230713 Retractable image projecting system 17 Sep 2008

2006239009 Pressure impulse mitigation 17 Sep 2008

2006242988 Distinguishing cells in a sample by inactivating extracellular enzyme before releasing
intracellular enzyme

17 Sep 2008

2006250982 Pressure impulse mitigation 17 Sep 2008

2006258230 A composition for wound healing and use thereof 17 Sep 2008

2006295040 Modified tobacco mosaic virus particles as scaffolds for display of protein antigens for
vaccine applications

17 Sep 2008

2006308016 Dispersion powder containing fatty acid anhydrides 17 Sep 2008

2006308023 Silane-modified dispersion powder 17 Sep 2008

2006338630 Fly ash beneficiation systems with sulfur removal and methods thereof 17 Sep 2008

2007249111 Touch screen switching assembly 17 Sep 2008

2008200748 A portable image projection device 17 Sep 2008
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Terms and Conditions
General

The information provided in this report is not in the nature of legal or other professional advice.

The information provided in this report is derived from third parties and may contain errors. You must
make your own enquiries and seek independent advice from the relevant industry professionals
regarding any information in this report.

Patents, patent applications, trademarks and trademark applications shown as lapsed or ceased may be
restored at a later date.

Disclaimer of warranty and limitation of liability

Neither IPMonitor, its affiliates nor any of their respective employees, agents, third party content
providers or licensors warrant that the information contained in this report is error free; nor do they
make any warranty as to the accuracy, reliability or content of any information in this report.

This report is provided on an "as is" basis; to the maximum extent permitted by law, IPMonitor
disclaims all representations and warranties, express or implied, with respect to any information
conatined in this report. In addition, IPMonitor does not represent or warrant that the information
contained in this report is accurate, complete or current.

This disclaimer of liability applies to any damages or injury caused by any failure of performance,
error, omission, interruption, deletion, defect, delay in operation or transmission, computer virus,
communication line failure, theft or destruction or unauthorized access to, alteration of, or use of
record, whether for breach of contract, tortious behavior, negligence, or under any other cause of
action.

Copyright

The content of this report may be protected by copyright laws and treaties around the world and all
rights relating to the same are reserved. Any paper or digital copies of this report are not to be
modified or any illustrations or any graphics used separately from any accompanying text.

Arbitration

Any dispute or difference whatsoever arising out of or in connection with this report shall be
submitted to arbitration in accordance with, and subject to, The Institute of Arbitrators & Mediators
Australia Rules for the Conduct of Commercial Arbitrations.

IPMonitor reserves the right to update the Terms and Conditions at any time without notice. Please
see the full Terms and Conditions at www.IPMonitor.com.au/trademarks/info/terms
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